
 Olde Towne 
Landscaping 

 Ellis Services, 
Inc. 

 Widewater Lawn 
Care 

21. AVERAGE HOURLY RATE (Used to determine the low bidder) 39.91$               61.86$               85.68$                   
Base Contract Period Average (add 22 items - 1a thru 11b, then divide by 22)

1. Rubber Tire Backhoe/Loader - JD 544, or equivalent.
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 65.00$               No bid 125.00$                 
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 65.00$               No bid 250.00$                 

2. Skid Steer Loader - S220, or equivalent.
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 45.00$               95.00$               125.00$                 
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 45.00$               125.00$            250.00$                 

3.
Dump Truck - Single axle, no less than 10 cubic yard capacity, 25,000 Gross
Vehicular Weight, or equivalent.
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 55.00$               65.00$               75.00$                   
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 55.00$               95.00$               150.00$                 

4.
Dump Truck - Tandem axle, no less than 15 cubic yard capacity, 50,000 Gross
Vehicular Weight, or equivalent. For delivery to staging area only.
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 60.00$               85.00$               100.00$                 
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 60.00$               115.00$            200.00$                 

5. Rubber tired Loader, JD 544, or equivalent.
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 65.00$               No bid No bid
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 65.00$               No bid No bid

6. Tractor with Bush Hog and Sidebar and/or Arm Mower
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 45.00$               105.00$            95.00$                   
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 45.00$               135.00$            170.00$                 

7.  Laborer without Tools or with Non-Powered Tools
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 19.00$               32.50$               30.00$                   
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 19.00$               40.00$               60.00$                   

8. Laborer with Powered Tools
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 19.00$               62.50$               40.00$                   
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 19.00$               75.00$               80.00$                   

9. Tree climber with power tools
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 24.00$               75.00$               No bid
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 24.00$               105.00$            No bid

10.  VDOT Certified Flagger
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 19.00$               29.50$               No bid
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 19.00$               37.50$               No bid

11. Supervisor - Working
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 23.00$               38.00$               45.00$                   
b.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Emergency Service 23.00$               46.00$               90.00$                   

12. Mobilization of Trailered Equipment when applicable
a.  Base Contract Period – Hourly Rate for Non-Emergency Service 150.00$            325.00$            125.00$                 
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